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HD.SINCE a NSW police officer was
murdered while in the line of duty

last week, there have been calls for
strong action against people who

incite violence against police. But to
what should such action be directed?
Should it be toward people inciting
violence against police, or people

seeking retribution against them for
past police brutality? In a loaded
statement issued this week, NSW

Police Commissioner Andrew
Scipione said it was “right that
people seeking to demonstrate

peacefully are prepared to accept the
consequences of their actions”. He
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also mentioned “insulting,
threatening, and intimidating

behaviour”, as well as “the wanton
destruction of public property”. But
should our laws be directed at those
who seek to incite violence against

police, or those who seek to express
their dissatisfaction with their

treatment on the streets? Most laws
against inciteful behaviour in NSW

are directed at people inciting
violence against others. What if

someone encourages others to riot,
or threatens to shoot police? What if

someone
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Tamizh, Anandhi, and Yogi Babu.
After Sandhya loses one of her
slippers gifted by her motherÂ .
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