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a volleyball game consists of three stages: the set, the game, and the match.
in the set, each team has a designated time to return the ball over the net to
the other team. the game is a continuation of the set. each team will have two
or more attempts to return the ball over the net. the match is a continuation of
the game. at the end of each set, each team will have five or more attempts to
return the ball over the net. the final stage is the match. the match begins
with each team having two attempts to return the ball over the net. at the end
of the match, the team with the most points is the winner. at the end of a
volleyball game, you will either win or lose. winning a game does not mean
that you will win the match. volleyball is also referred to as beach volleyball.
volleyball is always played at the beach. the game takes place on a sand
volleyball court. the sand is called the court. volleyball is a game of teamwork.
both teams are equal. if you want to win, you need to work together as a
team. volleyball is a game where you score points. points are scored by hitting
the ball over the net into the opposing team’s side. different types of volleyball
games exist. there are indoor games and outdoor games. indoor games
include basketball, table tennis, volleyball, etc. outdoor games include football,
cricket, tennis, etc. volleyball is played on a sand court, unlike basketball or
football. the court is divided into two sides. the side you are on is called your
court. on your court, there are two groups of lines called the net and the court.
the lines of the court are marked with small squares called volleyball
markings. all the volleyball markings are numbered in order from 1 to 15. each
team has two balls. the ball that goes in first belongs to the team on the
attacking side. the ball that goes in second belongs to the team on the
defensive side. the defensive team cannot hit the ball over the net into the
attacking team’s side before the first ball is in play.
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at the paris competition, venus ran out a gold medalist in the womens 3x3
basketball tournament, beating china, spain and russia. for me, im happy that
this games brought a lot of attention to the sport and to the growing visibility

of the 3x3 games, lawson said. im happy that its off to a good start. kara
lawson, who is a leader in the sport of 3x3 basketball, said that she had never
seen a world in which a sport as simple as 3x3 could be so popular. id say its
pretty amazing that its here today, she added. at the u.s. open in september,

venus williams, the first female tennis player to win the wimbledon title,
announced her retirement from tennis. her 18 major titles is a record that will
likely never be surpassed. the new, faster and taller volleyball net will be used

for the first time at the 2011 pan american games and the 2012 olympic
games, while the australian national volleyball team will debut its all-new,

state-of-the-art net in this weekend's world cup. the new net has been
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developed to meet the needs of world-class players in the 21st century. on
monday, sri lanka's sudden surge of popularity in the women's volleyball world

cup was a thing of the past. when the olympic bronze-medal-winning side
returned home from the games, the country was greeted with a nagging

question: how had it slipped so far down the international volleyball ladder?
but it's not just in women's volleyball that the national teams are struggling. in

men's volleyball, too, the indian men's team were on a bad run, which had
been noticed by the younger generation. and, like in women's volleyball, the
young generation who followed the teams closely had grown up watching the

national teams play in the past. 5ec8ef588b
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